
Tamoil Italia S.p.A. is part of Oilinvest
(Netherlands) B.V., an international operator
in the downstream sector.

✓ Network of 1300 service stations
throughout Italy.

✓ Jet business with major national and
international airlines.

✓ Wholesale to serve industry, agriculture
and public entities (sales above 800Kt/y).

✓ Lubricants with integrated production
(using the subsidiary SLI - Società
Internazionale Lubrificanti S.p.A.) and
marketing with two product lines:
“automotive” and “industry”.

✓ Storage capacity > 1Million m3 with
owned depot in Cremona, Trecate and
Venice (Decal); portion of storage
capacity rented to OCSIT.

✓ Owned pipeline system (370Km).

✓ Active in the CNG and LNG businesses
(with our affiliate DECAL).

✓ Developing national and international
Photovoltaic Projects (with our affiliate
DECAL).

✓ 2019 turnover: 4,7 Billion €.
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Tamoil Italia S.p.A.

We are a lean and dynamic company
developing our business in a sustainable
way.

We are committed to guaranteeing the
highest standards in terms of social
responsibility, in particular, on
"environmental protection" by adopting a
sustainable policy that aims to reduce
emissions and minimize waste production.

All our business processes comply with
the Quality Management System
Certification of the ISO 9001:2015
standard and we are actively committed
to achieving ever higher levels of
occupational health and safety for our
workers and contractors.

We offer high quality products such as
gasoline, diesel and special diesel oils with
additives, LPG, methane and highly
reliable and safe engine lubricating oils.

Our commercial objective is to guarantee
a proposal of services, loyalty programs
and prices, which is characterized as one
of the most competitive on the market.
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